

SALE #	MIN BID \$	BIDDER NAME	BID AMOUNT	10%
1	500.00	ANDREW VER HAAGH	2,001.00	201.10
1	500.00	JOHN COLLINS	973.00	97.30
1	500.00	COLLIN ANDERSON	501.00	50.10
1	500.00	MIKE & NICOLE SCHULTZ	800.00	80.00
1	500.00	THOMAS & TINA KEMPHER	600.00	60.00
1	500.00	JORDON & SHIRLEY SKALETSKI (-.09)	1,101.00	110.01
2	15,000.00	NO BID		
3	2,000.00	ANDREW VER HAAGH	3,555.00	355.50
3	2,000.00	KEN ANDERSON	2,026.00	202.60
4	7,000.00	CASORI ENTERPRISES INC.	8,350.00	835.00
4	7,000.00	LEROY & ROSE LONG	10,000.00	1,000.00
4	7,000.00	KIMBERLY & DEREK RASMUSSEN	8,132.00	813.20
4	7,000.00	SCOTT LAMBERT	7,000.00	700.00
5	1,000.00	CASORI ENTERPRISES INC.	1,500.00	150.00
5	1,000.00	COREY TELFORD	1,250.00	125.00
5	1,000.00	RODRIGO STINCHI	1,000.00	100.00
5	1,000.00	JOHN PANSIER	1,005.00	100.50
6	1.00	CITY OF OCONTO	1.00	
6	1.00	CASORI ENTERPRISES INC.	10.00	10.00
7	1.00	CITY OF OCONTO	1.00	
7	1.00	CASORI ENTERPRISES INC.	10.00	10.00
8	11,000.00	JEFF LAMBERT	11,670.00	1,167.00
8	11,000.00	NORMAN COURCHAIINE	15,800.00	1,580.00
8	11,000.00	FRED KOEHNE	15,200.00	1,520.00
8	11,000.00	ERIC SCHANAU	12,557.00	1,255.70
8	11,000.00	CASORI ENTERPRISES INC.	13,100.00	1,310.00
9	2,000.00	VINCENT & DEBRA CRIVELLO (+10.00)	2,100.00	220.00
10	40,000.00	NO BID		

11	12,000.00	BRANDON PICKETT		12,170.00	1,217.00
11	12,000.00	FRED KOEHNE	*	13,100.00	1,310.00
11	12,000.00	CASORIENTERPRISES INC.		12,500.00	1,250.00
12	500.00	BRANDON PICKETT		500.00	50.00
12	500.00	CASORIENTERPRISES INC.		500.00	50.00
13	2,000.00	CASORIENTERPRISES INC.		3,100.00	310.00
13	2,000.00	JEFF LAMBERT		2,170.00	217.00
13	2,000.00	WANDA LASTE		7,576.60	757.60
13	2,000.00	THOMAS & TINA KEMPHER		4,100.00	410.00
13	2,000.00	STEVE & KATHY SWIM		2,200.00	220.00
13	2,000.00	THOMAS WHITBURN		6,100.00	610.00
13	2,000.00	HOWARD VANDE VOORT	*	12,501.00	1,250.10
13	2,000.00	RICHARD & STACY KOZLOVSKY		2,500.00	250.00
13	2,000.00	KEN ANDERSON, ET AL		2,121.00	212.10
13	2,000.00	DAVID ENIGL (+133.67)		4,163.26	550.00
13	2,000.00	STEVEN & MAY KAHLER		5,110.00	511.00
13	2,000.00	TODD WILLIAM GIESE		2,550.00	255.00
13	2,000.00	STEVEN & FERRY MAREK		3,221.00	322.10
13	2,000.00	PETER KRAUSE		3,001.00	300.10
13	2,000.00	BRIAN ANDREWS		3,210.00	321.00
13	2,000.00	PETER CORFELD & LINDA KNUTSON		6,002.00	600.20
14	10,000.00	ROBERT & MICHELLE KREZMAN	*	12,100.00	1,210.00
15	10,000.00	NO BID			
16	11,200.00	NO BID			
17	100.00	CASORIENTERPRISES INC.	*	110.00	11.00
18	1.00	NO BID			
19	100.00	DENISE NELSEN	*	310.00	31.00
19	100.00	CASORIENTERPRISES INC.		110.00	11.00
20	25,000.00	DENNIS & MARGE ULLMAN (+500.00)	*	25,000.00	3,000.00
21	2,000.00	DANIEL SCHMIDT	*	2,600.00	260.00

21	2,000.00	RODRIGO STINCHI			2,000.00	200.00
21	2,000.00	PAUL REED, ET AL			2,200.00	220.00
22	88,400.00	NO BID				
23	23,400.00	CHRIS & MICHELL DESTERHEFT		*	58,800.00	5,880.00
23	23,400.00	JUDY & ROD BALDWIN			28,000.00	2,800.00
23	23,400.00	DALE & HEIDI MISSALL			28,000.00	2,800.00
23	23,400.00	PAUL & ELIZABETH SOBIECK			25,250.00	2,525.00
24	165,000.00	NO BID				
25	500.00	ROBERT & JODI COPPENS		*	1,000.00	100.00
26	100.00	CASORI ENTERPRISES INC.			110.00	11.00
26	100.00	ANDREW VER HAAGH		*	3,555.00	355.50
26	100.00	RICHARD & STACY KOZLOVSKY (-.09)			101.00	10.01
26	100.00	RODRIGO STINCHI			100.00	10.00
27	200.00	GARY WALKER		*	210.00	21.00
28	50,000.00	JOEL CAELWAERTS			54,000.00	5,400.00
28	50,000.00	ANTHONY GRULKOWSKI		*	71,000.00	7,100.00
28	50,000.00	ALAN & LISA SHALLOW			52,256.00	5,225.60
28	50,000.00	DANIEL MORIN & JUANITA RUECHEL			62,000.00	6,200.00
28	50,000.00	BRANDON PICKETT			56,065.00	5,606.50
29	19,500.00	DANNIE LEE HAUCH		*	20,155.00	2,015.50
30	5,000.00	NO BID				
31	100.00	RICHARD & MARJORIE HUJET		*	205.51	20.55
31	100.00	JESSE & NICOLE FIRGENS			200.00	20.00
31	100.00	CASORI ENTERPRISES INC.			110.00	11.00
31	100.00	MARK & KELLY WICHMAN			200.00	20.00
32	27,000.00	NO BID				
33	1,000.00	CITY OF OCONTO			1,000.00	
33	1,000.00	CASORI ENTERPRISES INC.			1,100.00	110.00
33	1,000.00	PAUL REED, ET AL			2,500.00	250.00
33	1,000.00	JEFF LAMBERT			1,070.00	107.00

34	40,000.00	NO BID				
35	25,000.00	NO BID				
36	500.00	CITY OF OCONTO		500.00		
36	500.00	THOMAS & BILLI DEQUAINE (-.18)		8,222.02		822.02
36	500.00	SCOTT LAMBERT		570.00		57.00
36	500.00	PAUL REED, ET AL		2,100.00		210.00
36	500.00	PAMELA ELLMAN & NANCY SHOEMAKER		510.00		51.00
36	500.00	CASORIENTERPRISES INC.		510.00		51.00
37	13,300.00	NO BID				
38	12,700.00	NO BID				
39	1,000.00	CITY OF OCONTO		1,000.00		
39	1,000.00	SCOTT LAMBERT		1,070.00		107.00
39	1,000.00	PAMELA ELLMAN & NANCY SHOEMAKER		1,010.00		101.00
40	100.00	CLAUDIE & DEANNA COOPMAN		100.00		10.00
41	5,000.00	CALVIN T. PENNEY & JESSICA SPALTNER-PENNEY		6,000.00		600.00
41	5,000.00	ERIC SCHANAU		5,557.00		555.70